|Lot2: Digital Era. Lot 3: NetSync Network Solutiony

'NOTICE OF INTENDED AWARD TO - FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST IN ACCORDANCE WITH BOARD OF GOVERNORS (BOG) REGULATION 18.002
OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHER SECURITY AS REQUIRED IN THE BOG REGULATION 18.002 AND 18.003(3), SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROTEST PROCEEDINGS. ALL
BIDS/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE UNIVERSITY ARE SUBJECT TO THE UNIVERSITY'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED

UNIVERSITY IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10% OF THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE PROTESTOR'S BID OR PROPOSAL; 10% OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE DURING THE CONTRACT
TERM; $10,000.00; OR WHICHEVER IS LESS. THE BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST THE PERSON OR ENTITY
FILING THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK, BANK OFFICIAL CHECK, OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF THE

THE FORMAL PROTEST SHALL RESULT IN DENIAL OF THE PROTEST. ' ,\\ \5 1 ; ~
Signature

UNIVERSITY OF FLORIDA BID TABULATION

Network Security Refresh Hardware

Bid No: | 'TB22NH-134 Req. No: Bid Name:
Opened: | May 10, 2022 at 3:00 PM Date of Award: | |5-31-2022 PO No:
Wendar BRD Ack. Attachment | Attachment | Attachment Attachment | Addendum
Form 1 2 3 4 1
5(' Digital Era Group 5-10-2022  10.11am & S90,869.09 233’31315? ) - X
X 386,950.00 | 367,479.08 -
CDW-G 5-10-2022 10.20am 665.265.94 - X
NetSync Network Soluti 592022 9.39 A - e X
etSync Network Solutions -O- .39am dfiached -
X - 369,174.00 See
SHI 5-10-2022 11.05am 669.512.00 attached - X
BRD = Bid Received Date AA=Acknowledged Addenda 1 Revised per GC

9/8/08 gem
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ITB22NH-134

Pricing Submission

Attachment 3: IPS Option 1A Firepower 4125x5

3yr Subscription with 1yr | 3yr Subscription with 3yr | 3yr Subscription
SSSNT SSSNT with 5yr SSSNT
Digital Era NO BID NO BID NO BID
CDW-G NO BID NO BID NO BID
NetSync $1,138,270.56 $1,425,958.16 $2,007,159.26
SHI $640,888.04 $785,044.50 $1,340,305.63

IPS Option 2A Firepower 4125x6

3yr Subscription with 1yr | 3yr Subscription with 3yr | 3yr Subscription
SSSNT SSSNT with 5yr SSSNT
Digital Era NO BID NO BID NO BID
CDW-G NO BID NO BID NO BID
NetSync $1,353,424.79 $1,692,365.35 $2,383,136.25
SHI $802,100.46 $923,576.00 $1,045,051.50

IPS Option 3A: Firepower 9300

3yr Subscription with 1yr
SSSNT

3yr Subscription with 3yr
SSSNT

3yr Subscription
with Syr SSSNT

Digital Era NO BID NO BID NO BID
CDW-G NO BID NO BID NO BID

> [ NetSync $941,520.03 $1,043,985.15 &K= | $1,431,700.05
SHI $950,233.50 $1,201,763.15 $1,456,292.85
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